
                BID TABULATION

PROJECT:  2022 Street Improvement Project ENGINEER: JACOBSON-WESTERGARD & ASSOC.

                       Buffalo Center, Iowa      E-21004                                105 South 6th Street

                               Estherville, IA  51334

OWNER:  City of Buffalo Center  

   BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME

REVISED BID DATE:  Monday, February 28, 2022 at 3:00pm    AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:

 COMPLETION DATE:  August 13, 2022 ENGINEER'S

ESTIMATE

 HMA/PCC Construction - 1st St NW (3rd Ave NW - 5th Ave NW) & 3rd Ave NW  

   Unit    Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No.                                 Item  Quantity Unit   Price    Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

1 Pavement Removal/Excavation 885 C.Y. 7.60$            6,726.00$      12.00$         10,620.00$    38.74$         34,284.90$      31.20$        27,612.00$   14.00$        12,390.00$       

2 Modified Subbase, 2” Depth 4,537 S.Y. 3.60$            16,333.20$    3.00$           13,611.00$    3.77$          17,104.49$      2.50$          11,342.50$   2.75$          12,476.75$       

3 Subgrade Preparation (Scarify & Recompact – 6”) 4,537 S.Y. 1.10$            4,990.70$      2.00$           9,074.00$      4.21$          19,100.77$      3.50$          15,879.50$   4.25$          19,282.25$       

4 6" x 30" PCC Curb & Gutter R/R 42 L.F. 42.62$          1,790.04$      60.00$         2,520.00$      58.85$         2,471.70$        42.00$        1,764.00$     45.00$        1,890.00$         

5 PCC Sidewalk Removal 1,286 S.F. 1.68$            2,160.48$      1.80$           2,314.80$      1.10$          1,414.60$        1.50$          1,929.00$     2.00$          2,572.00$         

6 4" PCC Sidewalk Construction 1,386 S.F. 7.00$            9,702.00$      9.00$           12,474.00$    8.00$          11,088.00$      8.80$          12,196.80$   6.25$          8,662.50$         

7 Detectable Warnings 64 S.F. 45.00$          2,880.00$      50.00$         3,200.00$      58.84$         3,765.76$        45.00$        2,880.00$     45.00$        2,880.00$         

8 HMA/PCC Pavement Removal (Driveways & 177 S.Y. 1.00$            177.00$         12.00$         2,124.00$      18.70$         3,309.90$        18.00$        3,186.00$     12.00$        2,124.00$         

9 6" PCC  Paving (Driveways & Patches) 39.2 S.Y. 90.00$          3,528.00$      80.00$         3,136.00$      117.70$       4,613.84$        98.00$        3,841.60$     50.00$        1,960.00$         

10 12" RCP Storm Sewer Pipe 200 L.F. 40.07$          8,014.00$      59.00$         11,800.00$    41.23$         8,246.00$        57.00$        11,400.00$   48.00$        9,600.00$         

11 15" RCP Storm Sewer Pipe 812 L.F. 37.59$          30,523.08$    64.00$         51,968.00$    48.61$         39,471.32$      61.00$        49,532.00$   58.00$        47,096.00$       

12 4'Ø Storm Manhole 8 V.L.F. 966.62$        7,732.96$      900.00$       7,200.00$      760.12$       6,080.96$        1,032.00$   8,256.00$     600.00$      4,800.00$         

13 Storm Sewer Cleanout, SW-203 (2 each) 8 V.L.F. 274.10$        2,192.80$      350.00$       2,800.00$      143.25$       1,146.00$        497.00$      3,976.00$     150.00$      1,200.00$         

14 Inserta Tee Lateral Connection 8 Each 262.50$        2,100.00$      450.00$       3,600.00$      237.50$       1,900.00$        3,032.00$   24,256.00$   400.00$      3,200.00$         

15 Intake, SW-501 2 Each 3,466.20$     6,932.40$      3,500.00$     7,000.00$      3,549.00$    7,098.00$        4,328.00$   8,656.00$     3,000.00$   6,000.00$         

16 Intake, SW-507 1 Each 3,653.99$     3,653.99$      4,000.00$     4,000.00$      5,164.00$    5,164.00$        5,300.00$   5,300.00$     5,000.00$   5,000.00$         

17 Removal of Existing Drainage Structures 4 Each 200.00$        800.00$         350.00$       1,400.00$      363.75$       1,455.00$        1,200.00$   4,800.00$     500.00$      2,000.00$         

18 Lateral Connections to New St. S. – Various Sizes (3”- 80 L.F. 51.10$          4,088.00$      80.00$         6,400.00$      40.95$         3,276.00$        50.00$        4,000.00$     25.00$        2,000.00$         

19 Earth Shouldering 12 Sta 306.67$        3,680.04$      370.00$       4,440.00$      436.91$       5,242.92$        600.00$      7,200.00$     300.00$      3,600.00$         

20 Seeding & Fertilizing (Urban) 48 SQ. 32.00$          1,536.00$      60.00$         2,880.00$      34.25$         1,644.00$        60.00$        2,880.00$     100.00$      4,800.00$         

21 Mulching 48 SQ. 32.00$          1,536.00$      60.00$         2,880.00$      34.25$         1,644.00$        40.00$        1,920.00$     50.00$        2,400.00$         

22 Adjustment of Fixtures 5 Each 1,000.00$     5,000.00$      500.00$       2,500.00$      214.80$       1,074.00$        850.00$      4,250.00$     700.00$      3,500.00$         

23 Mobilization 1 L.S. 26,200.00$   26,200.00$    40,000.00$   40,000.00$    42,257.00$  42,257.00$      30,000.00$ 30,000.00$   15,000.00$ 15,000.00$       

24 Traffic Control 1 L.S. 3,750.00$     3,750.00$      5,000.00$     5,000.00$      4,013.00$    4,013.00$        4,125.00$   4,125.00$     3,000.00$   3,000.00$         

25 HMA Full-Depth Patch, 8" Depth 115 S.Y. 74.45$          8,561.75$      122.70$       14,110.50$    131.29$       15,098.35$      135.00$      15,525.00$   60.00$        6,900.00$         

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 1-25. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ** 164,588.44$  227,052.30$  241,964.51$    266,707.40$ 184,333.50$     

Heartland Asphalt

Mason City, IA

Wicks Construction

Decorah, IA

Larson Contracting Central, LLC

Lake Mills, IA

Beck Excavating, Inc

Spirit Lake, IA
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PROJECT:  2022 Street Improvement Project              BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME

                       Buffalo Center, Iowa      E-21004              AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:

ALTERNATE BID (Not Awarded)
                                 

   Unit    Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No.                                 Item  Quantity Unit   Price    Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

10A 12” HDPE Storm Sewer Pipe 200.00 L.F. 30.84$          6,168.00$      50.00$         10,000.00$    25.84$         5,168.00$        49.00$        9,800.00$     45.00$        9,000.00$         

11A 15” HDPE Storm Sewer Pipe 812.00 L.F. 29.67$          24,092.04$    58.00$         47,096.00$    34.23$         27,794.76$      56.00$        45,472.00$   55.00$        44,660.00$       

SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE BID…................................. 30,260.04$    57,096.00$    32,962.76$      55,272.00$   53,660.00$       

             BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME

             AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:

 

HMA OPTION

    

   Unit    Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No.                                 Item  Quantity Unit   Price    Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

26 
Hot Mix Asphalt Standard Traffic, Surface Course, 

½” Mix, No Spcl. Fric. Req. (1.5" Depth)
3,981 S.Y.

8.27$            32,922.87$    8.85$          35,231.85$      9.25$          36,824.25$       

27 
Hot Mix Asphalt Standard Traffic, Intermediate 

Course, ½” Mix, No Spcl. Fric. Req. (2.5" Depth)
3,981 S.Y.

12.97$          51,633.57$    13.87$         55,216.47$      15.25$        60,710.25$       

28 
Hot Mix Asphalt Standard Traffic, Base Course, 3/4” 

Mix (4" Depth)
3,981 S.Y.

21.06$          83,839.86$    22.53$         89,691.93$      25.00$        99,525.00$       

29 Excavation 221 C.Y. 9.96$            2,201.16$      22.47$         4,965.87$        15.00$        3,315.00$         

30 6” x 30” PCC Curb & Gutter R/R 1,407 L.F. 26.96$          37,932.72$    58.85$         82,801.95$      40.00$        56,280.00$       

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 26-30…................................. 208,530.18$  267,908.07$    256,654.50$     

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 1-25…................................... 164,588.44$  241,964.51$    184,333.50$     

TOTAL BID HMA OPTION…...................................... ** 373,118.62$  No Bid 509,872.58$    No Bid 440,988.00$     

** CONTRACT AWARDED

ENGINEER'S

ESTIMATE

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

ENGINEER'S

ESTIMATE

Heartland Asphalt

Mason City, IA

Heartland Asphalt

Mason City, IA

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

Wicks Construction

Decorah, IA

Wicks Construction

Decorah, IA

Larson Contracting Central, LLC

Lake Mills, IA

Larson Contracting Central, LLC

Lake Mills, IA

Beck Excavating, Inc

Spirit Lake, IA

Beck Excavating, Inc

Spirit Lake, IA
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PROJECT:  2022 Street Improvement Project              BIDDER'S NAME

                       Buffalo Center, Iowa      E-21004              AND ADDRESS:

 PCC OPTION

    

   Unit    Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No.                                 Item  Quantity Unit   Price    Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

26A
Standard or Slipform Portland Cement Concrete, 

Class C, Class 3 Durability, 6-inch
4,380 S.Y.

57.50$         251,850.00$  67.97$         297,708.60$    68.00$        297,840.00$ 58.00$        254,040.00$     

27A 6" x 30" PCC Curb & Gutter Removal 1,407 L.F. 4.00$           5,628.00$      6.82$          9,595.74$        12.00$        16,884.00$   5.00$          7,035.00$         

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 26A & 27A.......................... 257,478.00$  307,304.34$    314,724.00$ 261,075.00$     

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 1-25…................................. 227,052.30$  241,964.51$    266,707.40$ 184,333.50$     

TOTAL BID PCC OPTION…..................................... No Bid 484,530.30$  549,268.85$    581,431.40$ 445,408.50$     

OPTIONAL BID (Not Awarded)

HMA/PCC Construction - 1ST ST NW (5TH Ave NW-6th Ave NW)

  

   Unit    Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No.                                 Item  Quantity Unit   Price    Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

1 Granular Surfacing Removal/Excavation 300 C.Y. 9.17$            2,751.00$      15.00$         4,500.00$      20.46$         6,138.00$        22.00$        6,600.00$     12.00$        3,600.00           

2 Subgrade Preparation (Scarify & Recompact – 6”) 1,340 S.Y. 1.68$            2,251.20$      2.00$           2,680.00$      4.35$          5,829.00$        3.50$          4,690.00$     4.25$          5,695.00           

3 6" x 30" PCC Curb & Gutter R/R 55 L.F. 39.55$          2,175.25$      60.00$         3,300.00$      60.83$         3,345.65$        42.00$        2,310.00$     45.00$        2,475.00           

4 PCC Sidewalk Removal 50 S.F. 10.00$          500.00$         1.80$           90.00$           4.86$          243.00$           1.50$          75.00$          2.00$          100.00              

5 4" PCC Sidewalk Construction 90 S.F. 7.00$            630.00$         9.00$           810.00$         8.30$          747.00$           8.80$          792.00$        6.25$          562.50              

6 Detectable Warnings 16 S.F. 45.00$          720.00$         50.00$         800.00$         60.81$         972.96$           45.00$        720.00$        45.00$        720.00              

7 Earth Shouldering 0.55 Sta 661.82$        364.00$         500.00$       275.00$         450.90$       248.00$           600.00$      330.00$        500.00$      275.00              

8 Seeding & Fertilizing (Urban) 2.20 SQ. 32.00$          70.40$           400.00$       880.00$         100.45$       220.99$           60.00$        132.00$        225.00$      495.00              

9 Mulching 2.20 SQ. 32.00$          70.40$           400.00$       880.00$         100.45$       220.99$           40.00$        88.00$          200.00$      440.00              

10 Mobilization 1 L.S. 2,000.00$     2,000.00$      5,000.00$     5,000.00$      4,542.00$    4,542.00$        6,500.00$   6,500.00$     5,000.00$   5,000.00           

11 Traffic Control 1 L.S. 750.00$        750.00$         2,000.00$     2,000.00$      830.00$       830.00$           825.00$      825.00$        1,000.00$   1,000.00           

OPTIONAL BID - SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 1-11…........... 12,282.25$    21,215.00$    23,337.59$      23,062.00$   20,362.50$       

ENGINEER'S

ESTIMATE

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

Heartland Asphalt

Mason City, IA

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

ENGINEER'S

ESTIMATE

Heartland Asphalt

Mason City, IA

Larson Contracting Central, LLC

Lake Mills, IA

Wicks Construction

Decorah, IA

Wicks Construction

Decorah, IA

Larson Contracting Central, LLC

Lake Mills, IA

Beck Excavating, Inc

Spirit Lake, IA

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:

Beck Excavating, Inc

Spirit Lake, IA
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PROJECT:  2022 Street Improvement Project              BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME

                       Buffalo Center, Iowa      E-21004              AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:

 

HMA OPTION

    

   Unit    Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No.                                 Item  Quantity Unit   Price    Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

12 
Hot Mix Asphalt Standard Traffic, Surface Course, 

½” Mix, No Spcl. Fric. Req. (2" Depth)
1,340 S.Y.

8.27$            11,081.80$    9.14$          12,247.60$      12.00$        16,080.00$       

13 
Hot Mix Asphalt Standard Traffic, Base Course, 3/4” 

Mix (4" Depth)
1,340 S.Y.

21.06$          28,220.40$    23.29$         31,208.60$      24.00$        32,160.00$       

15 Excavation 75 C.Y. 7.33$            549.75$         7.88$          591.00$           12.00$        900.00$            

16 Modified Subbase, 4” Depth 1,340 S.Y. 6.71$            8,991.40$      6.84$          9,165.60$        5.50$          7,370.00$         

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 12-16…................................. 48,843.35$    53,212.80$      56,510.00$       

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 1-11…................................... 12,282.25$    23,337.59$      20,362.50$       

TOTAL BID HMA OPTION…...................................... 61,125.60$    No Bid 76,550.39$      No Bid 76,872.50$       

             BIDDER'S NAME

             AND ADDRESS:

 PCC OPTION

    

   Unit    Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total   Unit   Total

No.                                 Item  Quantity Unit   Price    Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price   Price

12A
Standard or Slipform Portland Cement Concrete, 

Class C, Class 3 Durability, 6-inch
1,340 S.Y.

55.00$         73,700.00$    69.95$         93,733.00$      68.00$        91,120.00$   45.00$        60,300.00$       

13A Modified Subbase, 2" Depth 1,340 S.Y. 4.00$           5,360.00$      4.50$          6,030.00$        2.50$          3,350.00$     2.75$          3,685.00$         

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 12A & 13A......................... 79,060.00$    99,763.00$      94,470.00$   63,985.00$       

SUBTOTAL BID ITEMS 1-11…................................. 21,215.00$    23,337.59$      23,062.00$   20,362.50$       

TOTAL BID PCC OPTION…..................................... No Bid 100,275.00$  123,100.59$    117,532.00$ 84,347.50$       

**Optional Bid Not Awarded**

ENGINEER'S

ESTIMATE

   BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:

ENGINEER'S

ESTIMATE

   BIDDER'S NAME    BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:    AND ADDRESS:

Heartland Asphalt

Mason City, IA

Heartland Asphalt

Mason City, IA

Wicks Construction

Decorah, IA

Wicks Construction

Decorah, IA

Larson Contracting Central, LLC

Lake Mills, IA

Larson Contracting Central, LLC

Lake Mills, IA

Beck Excavating, Inc

Spirit Lake, IA

Beck Excavating, Inc

Spirit Lake, IA

   BIDDER'S NAME

   AND ADDRESS:
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