BID TABULATION

PROJECT: 2022 Drainage District No. 103 Engineer: Jacobson-Westergard & Associates, Inc.
Tile Improvements 105 South 6th Street
Humboldt County, IA  E-21111 Estherville, IA 51334
OWNER: Humboldt County Board of Supervisors
BID DATE: Monday, July 25, 2022 @ 9:00am BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME
AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS:
COMPLETION DATE: April 14, 2023
B & B Farm Drainage Reutzel Excavating, Inc Nels Pederson Co, Inc Holland Contracting Corp. |Denver Underground & Grading, InJLarson Contracting Central, LLQ ENGINEER'S
BASE BID - SECTION 1 Wallingford, 1A Burt, IA Badger, IA Forest City, 1A Denver, IA Lake Mills, 1A ESTIMATE
CONSTRUCTION ASSESSABLE TO PRIVATE LANDS
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Iltem Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1. |18” RCP Apron w/ animal guard 1.00| EA|$ 200500 (% 2005.00|$% 3,00000]|%$ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 [ $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 2,355.00 | $ 2,355.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
2. |18” RCP, 1500D 1,423.00| LF | $ 4434 [$ 63,095.82 | $ 42.00 | $ 59,766.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 71,150.00 | $ 46.00 [ $ 65,458.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 78,265.00 | $ 7789 |$%$ 110,837.47 | $ 52.00 | $ 73,996.00
3. |18” RCP, 2000D 1592.00| LF | $ 4434 $ 70,589.28 | $ 4350 | $ 69,252.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 79,600.00 | $ 48.00 ($ 76,416.00 | $ 55.00 [ $ 87,560.00 | $ 78.82 | $ 125/481.44 ($ 55.00 | $ 87,560.00
4. |15” RCP, 1500D 1,480.00 | LF | $ 3290 | $ 48,692.00| % 40.00 | $ 59,200.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 69,560.00 | $ 42.00 [ $ 62,160.00 | $ 49.00 [ $ 72,520.00 | $ 56.88 | $ 84,182.40|$ 40.00 | $ 59,200.00
5. |[12” RCP, 1500D 6200 | LF | $ 27.00 | $ 1,674.00 | $ 33.00 % 2,046.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 2,852.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 3,720.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 2,976.00 | $ 4576 | $ 2,837.12 | $ 35.00 | $ 2,170.00
6. |RCP Tee, 18" x 18" x 18" 100| EA|$ 565.00($ 565.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 1,191.00 | $ 1,191.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
7. |RCP Tee, 18" x 18" x 15" 100| EA|$ 565.00($ 565.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 1,191.00 | $ 1,191.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
8. |RCP Tee, 18" x 18" x 12" 100| EA|$ 565.00($ 565.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 1,191.00 | $ 1,191.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
9. |RCP Tee, 15" x 15" x 12" 100| EA | $ 490.00 | $ 490.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 780.00 | $ 780.00 ($ 970.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 1,250.00( % 1,250.00
10. |RCP Tee, 12"x 12" x 12" 100| EA|$ 47500 $ 475.00 [$  750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
11. |18" Dia. RCP Endcap 100| EA|$ 250.00|$ 250.00 | $ 250.00| $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00
12. |15" Dia. RCP Endcap 100| EA | $ 210.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00 [ $ 148.00 | $ 148.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 175.00
13. |12" Dia. RCP Endcap 200 EA | $ 190.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 135.00($ 270.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 300.00
14. |Reducer, 18" to 15", RCP 100 EA|$ 1,000.00|$ 1,000.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,330.00 | $ 1,330.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,091.00 | $ 1,091.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
15. |Intake Casting, 12" Dia. Beehive 100| EA|$ 250.00|$ 250.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 193.00 | $ 193.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
10" Dia. Hickenbottom Intake, Riser &
16. |Adapter 100 EA|$ 235.00|$ 23500 $ 650.00|$ 650.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 4,200.00 ([$ 375.00 | $ 375.00|$ 300.00|$% 300.00
17. |Tile Connections, Less than 8" Dia. 1200 | EA | $ 230.00 | $ 2,760.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 530.00 | $ 6,360.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 7,800.00 [$ 259.00 | $ 3,108.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 4,200.00
18. |Tile Connections, 8" Dia. and Larger 300| EA|$ 270.00( % 810.00 |$ 375.00| $ 1,125.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 630.00 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 2,550.00[$ 937.00|$% 2,811.00|$ 450.00| $ 1,350.00
19. |Exploratory Excavation 800| HR [ $ 160.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 2,560.00[$ 175.00( $ 1,400.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,000.00
20. |Mobilization 1.00| LS |$ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 14,500.00 | $ 14,500.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00| $32,155.00 | $ 32,155.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00
BASE BID - SECTION 1 $ 197,091.10 $ 222,389.00 $ 250,482.00 $ 243,439.00 $ 282,161.00 $ 372,917.43 $ 253,501.00
BASE BID - SECTION 2
CONSTRUCTION ASSESSABLE TO COUNTY SECONDARY ROADS
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
101 [15" RCP, 2000D 1800 | LF | $ 3290 | $ 592.20 | $ 62.00 | $ 1,116.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 86.00 | $ 1,548.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 1,440.00 | $ 5450 | $ 981.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 990.00
102 [Intake, SW-512 (IDOT), Case 1, 24" Dig 100 EA|$ 42500 % 425.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 [ $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 [ $ 2,435.00 | $ 2,435.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
Intake Casting, SW-604 (IDOT), Type 5
103 |Casting 100 EA|$ 350.00|$ 350.00 | $ 1,000.00|$ 1,000.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 635.00($ 635.00 |$ 300.00 | $ 300.00
104 |Road Ditch Regrade 100 LS |$ 2,750.00 | $ 2,750.00 [ $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 8,500.00 [ $ 8,333.00 | $ 8,333.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
105 |[Remove & Re-Lay 12" Intake 100| EA | S 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 353.00( $ 353.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
106 |Silt Fence, Installation and Removal 4000 | LF | $ 55.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 500 $%$ 200.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 500 | $ 200.00 | $ 8.00 (9% 320.00 | $ 550 (9% 220.00 | $ 400 (% 160.00
107 |Mobilization 1.00| LS |$ 700.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 1,000.00|$ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 [$ 943.00 | $ 943.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
BASE BID - SECTION 2 $ 741720 $ 9,116.00 $  11,600.00 $  24,798.00 $ 21,760.00 $ 13,900.00 $  11,750.00
|TOTAL BASE BID - SECTION 1 + SECTION 2 | $ 204,508.30 $ 231,505.00 $ 262,082.00 $ 268,237.00 $ 303,921.00 $ 386,817.43 $ 265,251.00
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PROJECT: 2022 Drainage District No. 103 BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME
Tile Improvements AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS:
Humboldt County, IA  E-21111
B & B Farm Drainage Reutzel Excavating, Inc Nels Pederson Co, Inc Holland Contracting Corp. |Denver Underground & Grading, InfLarson Contracting Central, LLQ ENGINEER'S
BID ALTERNATE #1 - SECTION 1 Wallingford, IA Burt, IA Badger, IA Forest City, IA Denver, IA Lake Mills, 1A ESTIMATE
CONSTRUCTION ASSESSABLE TO PRIVATE LANDS
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1. |24” RCP Apron w/ animal guard 100| EA|$ 241000($% 2,410.00|$ 3,500.00|% 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 [$ 5,600.00 | $ 5,600.00 [ $ 6,600.00 | $ 6,600.00 [ $ 2,784.00 | $ 2,784.00 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 1,750.00
2. |24” RCP, 1500D 1,42300| LF | $ 5998 [$ 85,351.54 | $ 56.00 | $ 79,688.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 92,495.00 | $ 62.00 [ $ 88,226.00 | $ 74.00 [ $ 105,302.00 | $ 92.83 | $ 132,097.09 | $ 60.00 | $ 85,380.00
3. |24” RCP, 2000D 1,592.00 | LF | $ 5998 | $ 95,488.16 | $ 57.00 | $ 90,744.00 | $ 66.00 | $ 105,072.00 | $ 64.00 [ $ 101,888.00 | $ 74.00 [ $ 117,808.00 | $ 90.75 | $ 144,474.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 103,480.00
4. 118" RCP, 1500D 1,480.00 | LF | $ 4434 1$ 65623.20 (% 42.00 | $ 62,160.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 69,560.00 | $ 48.00 ($ 71,040.00 | $ 55.00 [ $ 81,400.00 | $ 63.83|$ 94,468.40 | $ 52.00 | $ 76,960.00
5. |[12” RCP, 1500D 6200 | LF | $ 2700|$ 167400 | % 36.00 | $ 2,232.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 2,852.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 3,720.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 2,976.00 | $ 4576 | $ 2,837.12 | $ 35.00 | $ 2,170.00
6. |RCP Tee, 24" x 24" x 18" 100| EA|$ 640.00($ 640.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 1,621.00 | $ 1,621.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
7. |RCP Tee, 24" x 24" x 15" 100| EA|$ 640.00|$ 640.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 1,621.00 | $ 1,621.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
8. |RCP Tee, 24" x 24" x 12" 100 EA|$ 640.00 | $ 640.00 [ $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 1,621.00 | $ 1,621.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
9. |RCP Tee, 18" x 18" x 12" 100| EA|$ 565.00(8% 565.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 1,191.00 | $ 1,191.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
10. |RCP Tee, 12"x 12" x 12" 100 EA|$ 47500 | $ 475.00 [$ 850.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
11. |18" Dia. RCP Endcap 100| EA|$ 250.00 | $ 250.00|$ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00
12. |15" Dia. RCP Endcap 100| EA|$ 21000 $ 210.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 148.00 | $ 148.00 [ $ 175.00 | $ 175.00
13. |12" Dia. RCP Endcap 200 EA | $ 190.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 135.00($ 270.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 300.00
14. |Reducer, 24" to 18", RCP 100 EA|$ 131000|$% 1,310.00|$ 1,950.00| $ 1,950.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,521.00 | $ 1,521.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
15. [Intake Casting, 12" Dia. Beehive 100| EA | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 1,200.00 | % 1,200.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 700.00 ($ 193.00|$ 193.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
10" Dia. Hickenbottom Intake, Riser &
16. [Adapter 100| EA | $ 235.00 | $ 235.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 4,200.00 [ $ 375.00|$%$ 375.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
17. |Tile Connections, Less than 8" Dia. 1200 | EA|$ 23000|$ 2,760.00($ 275.00|$ 3,300.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 530.00 | $ 6,360.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 7,800.00 [$ 259.00|$ 3,108.00 [$ 350.00 | $ 4,200.00
18. |Tile Connections, 8" Dia. and Larger 300 EA | $ 270.00 | $ 810.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 1,125.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 630.00 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 255000 |$ 937.00($ 2,811.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 1,350.00
19. |Exploratory Excavation 800 HR|$ 160.00|$ 1,280.00($  150.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 2,560.00[$ 175.00|$ 1,400.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,000.00
20. |Mobilization 100 LS |$ 1,200.00|$ 1,200.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 [ $ 10,000.00 | $33,946.00 | $ 33,946.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00
BID ALTERNATE #1 - SECTION 1 $ 262,191.90 $ 270,149.00 $ 297,899.00 $ 301,779.00 $ 350,196.00 $ 427,616.61 $ 303,065.00
BID ALTERNATE #1 - SECTION 2
CONSTRUCTION ASSESSABLE TO COUNTY SECONDARY ROADS
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
101 18" RCP, 2000D 18.00 | LF | $ 4434 | $ 798.12 | $ 69.00 | $ 1,242.00 | $ 51.00 | $ 918.00 | $ 93.00 | $ 1,674.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 1,440.00 | $ 60.61 | $ 1,090.98 | $ 60.00 | $ 1,080.00
102 |Intake, SW-512 (IDOT), Case 1, 24" Dig 100| EA | $ 425.00 | $ 425.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 2,435.00 | $ 2,435.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
Intake Casting, SW-604 (IDOT), Type 5
103 |Casting 1.00 | EA 350.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 ($ 635.00|$%$ 635.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
104 [Road Ditch Regrade 1.00 | LS 2,750.00 | $ 2,750.00 [ $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 [ $ 8,500.00 | $ 8,500.00 [ $ 8,333.00 | $ 8,333.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
105 |[Remove & Re-Lay 12" Intake 1.00 | EA 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 3,700.00 [ $ 353.00|$ 353.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
106 |Silt Fence, Installation and Removal 40.00 | LF 55.00 [ $ 2,200.00 | $ 500 (% 200.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 500 (% 200.00 | $ 8.00 (% 320.00 | $ 550 1| $ 220.00 | $ 4.00|$ 160.00
107 [Mobilization 1.00 | LS 700.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 [$ 943.00 | $ 943.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
BID ALTERNATE #1 - SECTION 2 $ 7,623.12 $ 9,242.00 $ 11,618.00 $ 24,924.00 $ 21,760.00 $ 14,009.98 $ 11,840.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 - SECTION 1 + SECTION2 | ** $269,815.02 | $ 279,391.00 | $ 309,517.00 | $ 326,703.00 | $ 371,956.00 | $441,626.59 | $ 314,905.00 |
*CONTRACT AWARDED
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PROJECT: 2022 Drainage District No. 103 BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME
Tile Improvements AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS:
Humboldt County, IA  E-21111
B & B Farm Drainage Reutzel Excavating, Inc Nels Pederson Co, Inc Holland Contracting Corp. |Denver Underground & Grading, InfLarson Contracting Central, LLQ ENGINEER'S
BID ALTERNATE #2 - SECTION 1 Wallingford, IA Burt, IA Badger, IA Forest City, IA Denver, IA Lake Mills, IA ESTIMATE
CONSTRUCTION ASSESSABLE TO PRIVATE LANDS
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1. [18” RCP Apron w/ animal guard 1.00 | EA $ 3,400.00 | $ 3,400.00 $ 2,355.00 | $ 2,355.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
2. |18” HDPE Pipe, Dual Wall, Perforated | 1,423.00 | LF $ 38.00 | $ 54,074.00 $ 48.03|$ 68,346.69 | $ 65.00 | $ 92,495.00
3. |18” Polypropylene Pipe, Dual Wall 1,592.00 | LF $ 47.00 | $ 74,824.00 $ 63.06 | $ 100,391.52 ($ 70.00 | $ 111,440.00
4. 115" HDPE Pipe, Dual Wall, Perforated | 1,480.00 | LF $ 35.00 | $ 51,800.00 $ 3496 |$ 51,740.80 | $ 60.00 | $ 88,800.00
5. |12” HDPE Pipe, Dual Wall, Perforated 62.00 | LF $ 36.00 | $ 2,232.00 $ 31.05| % 1,925.10 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,480.00
6. |HDPE Tee, 18" x 18" x 18" 1.00 | EA $ 450.00 | $ 450.00 $ 518.00|$ 518.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
7. |HDPE Tee, 18" x 18" x 12" 1.00 | EA $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 $ 458.00($ 458.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
8. |HDPE Tee, 15" x 15" x 12" 1.00 | EA $ 325.00 | $ 325.00 $ 408.00 % 408.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
9. |HDPE Tee, 12" x 12" x 12" 1.00 | EA $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 $ 32400 (% 32400 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00
10. |18" Dia. RCP Endcap 1.00 | EA $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 $ 187.00( % 187.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00
11. |15" Dia. RCP Endcap 1.00 | EA $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 $ 17100 | $ 171.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 175.00
12. |12" Dia. HDPE Endcap 200 | EA $ 100.00 | $ 200.00 $ 113.00( $ 226.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 100.00
13. |Intake Casting, 12" Dia. Beehive 1.00 | EA $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 $ 193.00($% 193.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
10" Dia. Hickenbottom Intake, Riser &
14. |Adapter 1.00 | EA $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 $ 375.00($% 375.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
15. |Tile Connections, Less than 8" Dia. 12.00 | EA $ 275.00 | $ 3,300.00 $ 259.00 (% 3,108.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 2,400.00
16. |Tile Connections, 8" Dia. and Larger 3.00 | EA $ 375.00 | $ 1,125.00 $ 937.00 (% 2,811.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 900.00
17. |Exploratory Excavation 8.00 | HR $ 150.00 | $ 1,200.00 $ 175.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,000.00
18. |36” Nyloplast Storm Manhole 8.00 | EA $ 9,000.00 | $ 72,000.00 $ 7,690.00$ 61,520.00 (% 2,500.00|$% 20,000.00
19. |Mobilization 1.00| LS $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 $29,063.00 | $ 29,063.00 [ $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
BID ALTERNATE #2 - SECTION 1 $ 282,155.00 $ 325521.11 $ 339,140.00
BID ALTERNATE #2 - SECTION 2
CONSTRUCTION ASSESSABLE TO COUNTY SECONDARY ROADS
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
101 18" RCP, 2000D 18.00 | LF $ 35.00 | $ 630.00 $ 4011 | $ 72198 | $ 68.00 | $ 1,224.00
102 [Intake, SW-512 (IDOT), Case 1, 24" Dig 1.00 | EA $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 $ 2,435.00 | $ 2,435.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
Intake Casting, SW-604 (IDOT), Type 5
103 |Casting 1.00 | EA $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 $ 63500|($% 635.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
104 [Road Ditch Regrade 1.00 | LS $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 $ 8,333.00 | $ 8,333.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
105 |Remove & Re-Lay 12" Intake 1.00 | EA $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 $ 353.00(% 353.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
106 |Silt Fence, Installation and Removal 40.00 | LF $ 5001|% 200.00 $ 550 % 220.00 | $ 400 1| $ 160.00
107 [Mobilization 1.00| LS $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 $ 943.00 (% 943.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
BID ALTERNATE #2 - SECTION 2 $ 6,330.00 $ 13,640.98 $ 11,984.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE #2 - SECTION 1 + SECTION 2 No Bid $ 288,485.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 339,162.09 | $ 351,124.00 |
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PROJECT: 2022 Drainage District No. 103 BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME BIDDER'S NAME
Tile Improvements AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS: AND ADDRESS:
Humboldt County, IA  E-21111
B & B Farm Drainage Reutzel Excavating, Inc Nels Pederson Co, Inc Holland Contracting Corp. |Denver Underground & Grading, InfLarson Contracting Central, LLQ ENGINEER'S
BID ALTERNATE #3 - SECTION 1 Wallingford, IA Burt, IA Badger, IA Forest City, IA Denver, IA Lake Mills, IA ESTIMATE
CONSTRUCTION ASSESSABLE TO PRIVATE LANDS
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1. |24” RCP Apron w/ animal guard 1.00 | EA $ 3,800.00| % 3,800.00 $ 2,723.00 | $ 2,723.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
2. |24” HDPE Pipe, Dual Wall, Perforated | 1,423.00 | LF $ 4500 | $ 64,035.00 $ 58.10 | $ 82,676.30 (% 70.00 | $ 99,610.00
3. |24” Polypropylene Pipe, Dual Wall 1,592.00 | LF $ 5200 | $ 82,784.00 $ 7690 | $ 122,42480 | $ 75.00 | $ 119,400.00
4. |18” HDPE Pipe, Dual Wall, Perforated | 1,480.00 | LF $ 36.00 | $ 53,280.00 $ 46.90 | $ 69,412.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 96,200.00
5. |12” HDPE Pipe, Dual Wall, Perforated 62.00 | LF $ 36.00 | $ 2,232.00 $ 31.05|$%$ 1,925.10 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,480.00
6. |HDPE Tee, 24" x 24" x 18" 1.00 | EA $ 700.00 | $ 700.00 $ 762.00|% 762.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00
7. |HDPE Tee, 24" x 24" x 12" 1.00 | EA $ 700.00 | $ 700.00 $ 662.00]% 662.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00
8. |HDPE Tee, 18" x 18" x 12" 1.00 | EA $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 $ 454.00 | $ 454.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
9. |HDPE Tee, 12" x 12" x 12" 1.00 | EA $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 $ 324001 % 324.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00
10. |18" Dia. RCP Endcap 1.00 | EA $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 $ 187.00|$% 187.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00
11. |15" Dia. RCP Endcap 1.00 | EA $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 $ 171001 3% 171.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 175.00
12. |12" Dia. HDPE Endcap 2.00 | EA $ 100.00 | $ 200.00 $ 113.00| 3% 226.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 100.00
13. |Intake Casting, 12" Dia. Beehive 1.00 | EA $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 $ 193.00| % 193.00 | $ 300.00 | 300.00
10" Dia. Hickenbottom Intake, Riser &
14. |Adapter 1.00 | EA $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 $ 375.00|% 375.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
15. |Tile Connections, Less than 8" Dia. 12.00 | EA $ 275.00 | $ 3,300.00 $ 259.00|% 3,108.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 2,400.00
16. |Tile Connections, 8" Dia. and Larger 3.00 | EA $ 375.00 | $ 1,125.00 $ 937.00|% 2,811.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 900.00
17. |36” Nyloplast Storm Manhole 8.00 | HR $ 9,000.00 | $ 72,000.00 $ 7,690.00 | $ 61,520.00 % 2,500.00 ($ 20,000.00
18. |Exploratory Excavation 8.00 | EA $ 150.00 | $ 1,200.00 $ 175.00|$ 1,400.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,000.00
19. |Mobilization 1.00| LS $ 17,000.00 | $ 17,000.00 $30,909.00 | $ 30,909.00 ( $ 17,000.00 | $ 17,000.00
BID ALTERNATE #3 - SECTION 1 $ 304,731.00 $ 382,263.20 $ 363,865.00
BID ALTERNATE #3 - SECTION 2
CONSTRUCTION ASSESSABLE TO COUNTY SECONDARY ROADS
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Quantity |Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
101 |18" HDPE, DUAL WALL 18.00 | LF $ 62.00 | $ 1,116.00 $ 40.72 | $ 73296 | $ 55.00 | $ 990.00
102 |Intake, SW-512 (IDOT), Case 1, 24" Dig 1.00 | EA $ 2,800.00| % 2,800.00 $ 243500 % 2,435.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
Intake Casting, SW-604 (IDOT), Type 5
103 |Casting 1.00 | EA $ 1,000.00| $ 1,000.00 $ 635.00]% 635.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
104 |Road Ditch Regrade 1.00| LS $ 2,000.00| % 2,000.00 $ 8,333.00( % 8,333.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
105 |Remove & Re-Lay 12" Intake 1.00 | EA $ 1,000.00| $ 1,000.00 $ 353.00|% 353.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
106 |Silt Fence, Installation and Removal 40.00 | LF $ 5.00 (% 200.00 $ 550 (9% 220.00 | $ 400 | $ 160.00
107 [Mobilization 1.00| LS $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 $ 943.00| 3% 943.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
BID ALTERNATE #3 - SECTION 2 $ 9,116.00 $ 13,651.96 $ 11,750.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE #3 - SECTION 1 + SECTION 2 No Bid $ 313,847.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid | $395,915.16 | $ 375,615.00 |
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